
ENCYCLOPEDIA OF BIBLE DIFFICULTIES

tributive justice. Moreover, since the
sinless Son of God has su premely man­
ifested God's wrath against sin by of­
fering up His own life on the cross as
an atonement for the sins of mankind,
it is not so imperative as it was in the
Old Testament age for God to man­
ifest His righteousness through penal
judgments of a catastrophic kind.

It is less appropriate for ew Tes­
tament believers to offer up the same
call for vengeance as this psalm ex­
presses. Nevertheless we must not ig­
nore the passages found even in the
latest New Testament book of all, Rev­
elation, which in 6: 10 articulates the
appeal of the martyred saints from the
time of the Tribulation: "How long, 0
Lord. holy and true, wilt Thou refrain
from judging and avenging our blood
on those who dwell on the earth?" As
the arrogant godlessness of the End
Time mounts to a Satan-inspired cli­
max of brutality and bloodshed, it is
appropriate to pray with great ear­
nestness that God will intervene to
crush the wicked and visit on a rebelli­
ous world the destruction that it so
richly deserves.

Does the Bible class abortion with mur­
der?

Surgical abortion was hardly possi­
ble until the development of modern
technique in the operating room; in
ancien't times the babies were killed in
the womb only when their mother was
also slain. An example is Amos 1:13:
"Thus says the LORD, 'For three trans­
gressions of the sons of Ammon and
for four I will not revoke its punish­
ment, because they ripped open the
pregnant women of Gilead in order to
enlarge their borders'" (NASB). But
now that the United States Su preme
Court has questioned the human status
of a fetus in the womb until it reaches
an advanced stage of gestation, it be­
comes essential to establish from Scrip­
ture what God's view is on this matter.

246

At what stage does God consider the
fetus to be a human being, so that the
taking of its life may be considered
manslaughter?

Psalm 139: 13 indicates very defi­
nitely that God's personal regard for
the embryo begins from the time of its
inception. The psalmist says, "For
Thou didst form my inward parts;
Thou didst weave me in my mother's
womb" (NASB). Verse 16 continues,
'Thine eyes have seen my unformed
substance; and in Thy book they were
all written, the days that were ordained
for me, when as yet there was not one
of them" (NASB). It is reassuring to
know that even though many thou­
sands of embryos and fetuses are de­
liberately aborted every year through­
out the world, God cares about the
unborn and takes personal knowledge
of them just as truly before they are
born as after their delivery. He has
their genetic code all worked out and
has a definite plan for their lives (ac­
cording to v.16).

In Jeremiah 1:5 the Lord says to the
young prophet on the threshold of his
career, "Before I formed you in the
womb I knew you, and before you
were born I consecrated you; I have
appointed you a prophet to the na­
tions" (NAsB). This certainly implies
that God foreknew thi lad even before
he was conceived in his mother's womb.
Apparently we human beings have an
identity in God's mind that is estab­
lished "from everlasting"-long before
conception as an embryo. Second,
the verse teaches that it is God Himself
who forms that fetus and governs and
controls all those "natural" processes
that bring about the miracle of human
life. Third, God has a definite plan and
purpose for our lives, and each of us
really matters to Him. Therefore any­
one who takes the life of any human
being at any stage in his life's career
will have to reckon with God. "Who­
ever sheds man's blood, by man his
blood shall be shed, for in the image of
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